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Frequently Asked Questions: COVID-19  
 

 

Is Haartz still using the facial recognition and temperature scanners at the door?  
 
Yes.  Haartz continues to use the facial recognition for employees to gain entry to the facilities.  Please 
continue to enter only after using the scanner.   Temperatures will be displayed for information, but not 
monitored or reported. Facial recognition will be installed at the middle door of the office parking lot and 
patio area by close of business on 7.28.21.  Until that time, employees are expected to use a door that has 
facial recognition installed prior to entering the building.  
 
What is the current policy if I have been a close contact of someone who tested positive for COVID 19 that 
doesn’t reside in my home?   
 
Employees, whether vaccinated or not, who are close contacts of someone who has tested positive are 
expected to wear a mask for 5 days following the date they were in contact with the person and test daily for 

the first 5 calendar days (excluding weekends).  CDC’s Critical Infrastructure Guidance advises that critical 
infrastructure workers may be permitted to continue work following potential exposure to coronavirus 
disease 2019 (COVID-19), provided they remain asymptomatic, have not had a positive test result for COVID-
19, and additional precautions are implemented to protect them and the community.  
 
What is the policy for Haartz regarding masks? 
 

Anyone who has chosen not to be vaccinated, or has not completed the waiting period is required to wear a 
mask in all public areas at Haartz.   
 
Employees who are fully vaccinated and have completed the waiting period are not required to wear a mask 
provided they have not been in close contact with anyone who has tested positive. Employees are expected to 
notify their supervisor or manager if they have been named as a close contact with someone outside of work 
who has tested positive.  
 
Employees who are fully vaccinated will be required to wear a mask for 5 calendar days following the date of 
the close contact with the person who tested positive.   
 
What is the Haartz policy on testing?  
 
All employees, visitors and temporary employees who have not shown proof of vaccination, are not 
vaccinated, or have not completed the waiting period will be required to test twice weekly. Testing will 
typically take place on Tuesday and Thursday through the supervisor/ manager.  Masks are still required to be 
worn following the testing. Employees who are close contacts of someone who tested positive from COVID 
will be required to wear a mask for 5 calendar days regardless of vaccination status.   
 
What is the vaccination rate at Haartz?  
 

Haartz is pleased to report that nearly 87% of employees are fully vaccinated.   

https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/community/critical-workers/implementing-safety-practices.html
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Are there restrictions on conference rooms and the cafeteria?  
 

Haartz removed all restrictions following a similar action by the Commonwealth of Mass.   Employees who are 
not fully vaccinated are asked to maintain a six-foot distance from others.  
 

Can employees have lunch on the patio again? 
 

Yes. The patio has reopened, and everyone should feel free to make use of it.  
 
 

When will the computers be available for use in the cafeteria?  
 

The computer stations have been returned for use in the cafeteria.   Employees are asked to clean the 
workstation before and after use for the health and safety of others.  This is suggested “good practice” to 
prevent spread of bacteria and viruses. 
 

When will the social events committee start planning events again? 
 

Haartz is working to resume this as vaccination rates increase and restrictions are lifted around the state and 
region.  
 
 

Should I continue testing after I have been vaccinated for COVID 19? 
 

Once employees have completed the waiting period following their vaccine, they should provide a copy of 
their vaccination card to HR and they will be removed from the testing rotation. Those who would like to 
continue to get tested for COVID 19 after they are vaccinated can do so by notifying HR or their supervisor or 
manager.  
 
Do I need to get tested before returning from personal travel if I have been vaccinated?  
Employees who have been fully vaccinated and have completed the 14-day waiting period for maximum 
immunity are exempt from these policies.  
 

How can I get a COVID 19 Vaccine?  
 

All employees in MA are eligible to get a vaccine at this point. Please feel free to come to HR for assistance 
booking a vaccine appointment.   
 
What should you do if you feel sick but are unsure if you have contracted COVID-19? 
 

Employees are encouraged to stay home if they are sick.   They should notify their supervisor or manager to 
request a test.  Haartz was recently able to purchase rapid test kits in bulk and employees are eligible to 
purchase them at our cost of $16 for a 2-pack ($8 per test). Employees who wish to contact their doctor can 
do that as well for treatment but testing should be arranged through Haartz HR department to ensure timely 
testing and receipt of results.      
 

How will employees be paid when they are out of work due to sickness or need to quarantine due to having 
a positive COVID test in their household?  
 

Employees can use sick time, vacation time or e-sick if it is COVID related.  Employees qualify for an additional 
40 hours of supplemental sick time in 2021 due to COVID. Employees will be required to complete a Request 
for Supplemental COVID Sick Time form and submit it for approval to their manager and HR to qualify.  Forms 
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are available on the COVID 19 section of Haartznet. If employees have exhausted their time, leave without pay 
will be used and employees may qualify for Pandemic Unemployment Assistance.  FMLA or Mass Paid Family 
Leave may be available for serious medical conditions.  
 

If I am asymptomatic and someone in my household has COVID-19, am I expected to come to work? 
 

Haartz requires that employees who are not fully vaccinated and have someone that lives in their residence 
who tested positive stay home until the end of the CDC recommended quarantine period.  If the infected 
person no longer has symptoms, CDC guidance suggests that the employee should not return to work before 7 
days from the date of the positive test, provided they have received a negative test after day 5. If the infected 
person is still symptomatic, the employee should remain quarantined for 10 days from the date of the positive 
test. The employee should continue to quarantine until the infected person’s symptoms improve.  The 
employee will be required to obtain a negative test before returning to work. They should communicate 
regularly with their manager or supervisor and monitor for symptoms.   
 

What do I need to do if I test positive for COVID 19?  
 

Employees who have tested positive for COVID 19 are expected to provide their supervisor with a copy of the 
positive test result. Once they have completed the CDC quarantine period, they should come to work and 
monitor for symptoms.   The CDC guidelines do not recommend waiting for a negative test result because the 
virus will often remain in your system for a period of up to three months even though you are no longer 
contagious.  
 

How long do employees who test positive for COVID 19 but are asymptomatic need to stay out of work?  
 

People who are asymptomatic and test positive for COVID 19 need to stay out of work for 10 days from the 
date they had the positive test.  A negative test is not required to return to work per CDC guidelines.  
 

What documentation is needed to return to work following a positive COVID 19 test result?  
 

Haartz requires a copy of the positive test, and requires the employee to attest that it is has been at least 10 
days since the symptoms first appeared and that they have been fever free for at least 24 hours without fever 
reducing medication.   Per the CDC, loss of taste and smell may persist for weeks or months after recovery and 
need not delay the end of isolation.  
 

What do I do if I have symptoms that may be related to COVID 19 but haven’t been tested?  
 

Employees who are sick should let their manager know they need a test and coordinate with HR for a testing 
appointment with Emerson.  Employees who cannot work from home can use sick time, vacation time or e-
sick time when applicable.  If all time has been exhausted, employees will need to take leave without pay.  
Pandemic Unemployment Assistance may be available in certain cases.  
 

What do employees need to do if they are symptomatic and receive a negative test result?  
 

If a negative test result is received, employees should continue to stay home monitoring symptoms and talk to 
their supervisor daily to determine when it is appropriate for them to return to work.  Employees can use sick 
time, vacation time or e-sick time, when applicable.  If all time has been exhausted, employees will need to 
take leave without pay.  
 

 
 

http://haartznet/
https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/if-you-are-sick/quarantine.html
https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/if-you-are-sick/isolation.html
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What do employees do if they thought they may be having COVID 19 symptoms when they feel better?  
 

Employees who are out sick should continue to have daily contact by phone with their supervisor or manager 
and work together to determine a return-to-work plan based on symptoms and test results.   Employees need 
to self-certify that they no longer have symptoms and have been fever free without fever-reducing medication 
for 24 hours prior to returning to work.  
 
What do employees have to do before they return to work if they travel for personal reasons?  
 

Employees who are not fully vaccinated and travel by air to / from any destination in the United States require 
a negative Rapid or PCR test prior to returning to work at a Haartz facility.    Employees should plan ahead 
when traveling and work with HR or their supervisor to coordinate a COVID test before they leave for when 
they return to Massachusetts.   International travel will require a 7-day self- quarantine per CDC updated 
guidelines and a negative test taken between days 3-5 following the return to MA prior to returning to work. 
 
What should I do if I need to travel for business outside of Massachusetts?  
 

All business travel is extremely limited at this time and requires approval from John Fox, President. Employees 
who are not fully vaccinated and travel by air to / from any destination in the US will require a negative COVID 
test to return to work at a Haartz facility.  Employees traveling for business should make arrangements with 
HR to coordinate a test upon their return.  International travel will also require a 7-day self-quarantine 
following the return to MA.   
 

Will Haartz pay for a COVID 19 test due to traveling?  
 

All COVID 19 tests required following business travel will be reimbursed. The cost of the COVID test will be 
deducted through payroll for personal travel.  Rapid COVID tests are available at our cost of $16 for a 2-pack 
($8 per test) and will be accepted for clearance to return to work.  The cost of these tests will be recovered 
through payroll deduction.  Employees will need to make arrangement prior to their trip to obtain the test kit 
and will be required to submit a copy of the results to their manager and Alysse Taylor and Mary Tighe in HR 
prior to returning to the office. 
 

Can employees work from home while they wait for negative test results?  
 

Employees may be eligible to work from home in certain circumstances while waiting for test results.  If 
working from home is not an option, employees will be required to use vacation time until such time a 
negative test result has been received.  If the employee is out of vacation or sick time, then any quarantine 
period will be unpaid.  
 

What are the symptoms of COVID 19?  
 

People with COVID-19 have had a wide range of symptoms reported – ranging from mild symptoms to severe 
illness. These include fever or chills, cough, shortness of breath or difficulty breathing, fatigue, muscle or body 
aches, headache, new loss of taste or smell, sore throat, congestion or runny nose, nausea or vomiting, and 
diarrhea.  

Where can employees go to get a COVID test?  

Haartz purchased saliva PCR kits through Genomic Expressions that we have available onsite.  Tests will be 
sent to the lab as needed via a courier and results are generally available on the same day or the following 
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day. We also have BinaxNow Rapid Antigen tests available onsite. Please contact your supervisor or HR to 
schedule an appointment to find out more information about obtaining a test.  
 

What happens if I test positive on a Rapid Antigen test? 
 

Negative test results have a very high accuracy rate on a rapid antigen test (99%+).  There are times that a 
false positive may occur.  If someone tests positive on a rapid test, they will be given a saliva-based PCR test 
that will be couriered to the lab for confirmation.  Employees will need to go home to quarantine pending test 
results.  If the PCR result comes back negative, they will be expected to return to work.  Those that are 
confirmed positive will be required to stay home to quarantine per CDC guidelines. 
 

What options are there if I am not comfortable taking a nasal swab test? 

Haartz has engaged with Genomic Expressions, a company offering PCR saliva testing.   Please see your 
supervisor or Alysse in HR to request this option.  


